
 
June Newsletter  

MONTHLY VIRTUE 

 
Our Monthly Virtue for June continues to be 
Self-Control.   If you learn self-control, you 
can master absolutely anything.  

INSTRUCTIONAL FOCUS 
In Language Arts and Mathematics, we are 
working hard in reviewing concepts taught 
throughout the year. We are extremely 
proud of our students for all their hard work 
in regards to our school wide Literacy and 
Numeracy Academic plans. They are 
becoming critical thinkers!  

 

 

PROFESSIONAL ACTIVITY DAY 

 
Monday, June 10 is a Professional Activity 
Day for teachers. There is no school on this 
day for students. Enjoy your long weekend! 

 
TOUGH KIDDER 

 
Our Annual Tough Kidder is on Wednesday, 
June 12. Pledges are due in the office on 
Friday, June 7. Proceeds go towards 
Student Activities and the Grade 7 & 8 
Educational Trip. Thank you for your 
ongoing support!  
 

GRADE 7 & 8 EDUCATIONAL 
TRIP 

 
Our Grade 7 & 8 students are away on their 
Educational Trip leaving on Monday, June 
17 and returning on Friday, June 21. It is 
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going to be a great time! Pictures will be 
posted on our school Facebook page.  

INDIGENOUS DAY 

 
We will be participating in planned activities 
for Indigenous Day on Friday, June 21. 
More information to come…. 
 

GRADE 8 GRADUATION 
 

 
Grade 8 Graduation 

Tuesday, June 25 
@ 7:00 pm at the Church 

 
REPORT CARDS 

 

Report cards are being sent home with 
your child at the end of the day on 
Wednesday, June 26.  

LAST DAY 

 
The official last day of school is Thursday, 
June 27 followed by a PA Day on Friday, 
June 28.  Last Day is also Pajama Day! 
Hooray!  
 

As always, please don’t hesitate to contact 
the school if you have any questions and/or 
concerns. Your continued support and 
understanding are greatly appreciated!  

A sincere “THANK YOU” for sharing your 
children with us! Have a wonderful and safe 
summer vacation! See you in September!  

 
Yours in Catholic Education,  
Andrea Iserhoff 

Principal  
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